AWARDING Bid Tabulation 121268

Project: Unit-Price Electrical Services

Bid Opening: 3.
Project No.: 12126S Approval: City Manager/Date
Contract Term: 3-Yrs with possible 1-Yr extention ;
o S Project Manager: Randy Pitney Contract Term: DEC%.&M:_&EMBEE@MS
AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

| recommend award of the highlighted section to Core

Northwest, LLC., as they were the lowest responsive bid
rom a responsible bidder and the highlighted section to
Knobel's Electric, Inc., as they were the only responsive

bid fro responsible bidder. Bigfoot Electric, LLC. | Core Northwest, LLC. | Knobel's Electric, Inc. | Titan Electrical, LLC.

BUYER / DATE

No. | Description [Qty.] Unit | Unit Price] Total Price | Unit Price| Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
Low Voltage, Low Voltage, Low Voltage, Low Voltage,
Electical Services Provided.|Electrical Construction, |Electrical Electrical Construction, [Electrical Construction,

Electric Vehicle Construction, Electric Vehicle Electric Vehicle
Charging Station, Electric Vehicle Charging Station, Charging Station,
Exterior Lighting, Charging Station, Exterior Lighting, Exterior Lighting,
Interior Lighting Exterior Lighting, Interior Lighting, Interior Lighting,

|Interior Lighting,

Panel Manufacturing & |Panel Manufacturing & |Panel Manufacturing &

Upgrading Upgrading Upgrading

Street Lighting Street Lighting

llluminated Signs llluminated Signs

HVAC Wiring & Install |HVAC Wiring & Install

Traffic Sign

Installation &
Replacement,

High Voltage,

Power Line/Pole
Construction &
Relocation,

Traffic Control Devices
& Signals,

Traffic Loop,

High Voltage Electrical
Testing,

Transformer
Maintenance & Repair




AWARDING Bid Tabulation 121268

No. [ Description [ Qty.| Unit | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
Labor - Regular
1 [Labor Rate per Hour by Licensed Electrician 1 HR 140.00 140.00 86.45 86.45 126.00 126.00 125.00 125.00)
2 |Labor Rate per Hour by Certified Apprentice 1 HR 140.00 140.00 86.45 86.45 98.00 98.00 105.00 105.00
. - TP s P
p ot {Livied Wige Cheithaubal@ aented. | 4 | No Bid 0.00]  75.00 7500 116.00  116.00]  NoBid 0.00
to be utilized on this contract)
Other Unidentified Labor (if other labor classifications
4 |become necessary to completer this work). Indicate the % No_Bid % 18 % 20 % No Bid %
over prevailing wage rate to be charged.
1st Hour of Labor $280 -
Comments: |Minumin Trip if labor is
under 7-hours.
Labor - After Hours, Holidays, Overtime
i 5, holidays &
g |AREFORERR I i, Hollrys i | nr | 22000] 22000| 146.84)  146.84] 21500  215.00] 250.00]  250.00}
overtime by Licensed Electrician
g |ufter mofinl buiicss b, hohiceys & 1 | HR 220.00 22000| 146.84 146.84|  165.00 165.00 210.00 210.00]
overtime by Certified Apprentice
i ificati i :
y [ooaer (LIRS WE ERRRGRDnE el oy . No Bid 000] 140.00| 140.00] 197.00] 197.00] NoBid 0.00
to be utilized on this contract)
Other Unidentified Labor (if other labor classifications
8 |become necessary to completer this work). Indicate the % No_Bid % 18 % 20 % No_Bid %
over prevailing wage rate to be charged.
1st Hour of Labor $440 -
Comments:|Minumin Trip if labor is
under 7-hours
Labor - Emergency
Hour fi ' call out by
P i i ek P B 220.00 220.00 86.45 86.45|  215.00 21500  125.00 125.00]
Licensed Electrician
F  call out by
g |oon Rals e Eir topeaiegency gall ooy o 220.00 220.00 86.45 86.45]  165.00 165.00]  105.00 105.00
Certified Apprentice
i ‘lassificati i - ;
i | Prher(Listsdiage Clasicsnenyirtendtd | o | w1 - 1Ko Big 0.00]  75.00 75.00] 197.00]  197.00] NoBid 0.00
to be utilized on this contract)
Other Unidentified Labor (if other labor classifications
12 [become necessary to completer this work). Indicate the % No Bid | 18 % 20 % No_Bid %
over prevailing wage rate to be charged.
1st Hour of Labor $440 -
Comments:|Minumin Trip if labor is
under 7-hours




No. |

Description

AWARDING Bid Tabulation 121268

[Qty.] Unit [ Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price] Total Price ] Unit Price] Total Price ] Unit Price] Total Price

Parts and Materials
All Parts & Materials must be IEC/NEC Certified.

Method Used for Calculating Parts/Materials Cost

(Chose One)
13-a|Parts and Materials Cost Plus (+) 1 EA | (¥) 40 % | (+) 18 % | (+) 25 %| (+) 15 %
13-b|(Or) Parts and Materials List Minus (-) 1 EA | () N/A % | (-) N/A % | (-) N/A %l (-) N/A %
F: I id in):
—-— (Or) Parts and Materials Other (explain) $  NA / wls  NA / wls wNA / wls NA / %
14 llems'not listed: list .dlscount. offered off list prices for any No Bid N/A N/A No Bid
other items not specifically listed
Payment Discount / Terms: None 2% / Net 30 2% [ Net 5 5% / Net 10
Freight FOB destination: INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
Service Time:
Maximum Two (2) Business Days 2 Days 24 Hours 1 Day 2 Days
Emergency Call-Out Service Time:
Maximum Sixty (60) Minutes 1 Hour 30 Minutes 1 Hour 60 Minutes
Comments:




